LCS Bid No. 5450-2018

Description: PETROLEUM PRODUCTS — ENGINE OILS, LUBRICANT & ANTIFREEZE

Department: TRANSPORTATION

Opening Date: MAY 10, 2017 @ 1:00 P.M.

Crawford & Sons Oil Eli Roberts & Sons Five Points McPherson Oil Ware Oil & Supply
Co, Inc. Services Products Co. Inc.

1.ENGINE OIL

A. Price per Gallon (bulk) $6.89 $6.92 $11.00 $5.89 $6.94

B. Price per Gallon (drum) $7.39 ($406.45) $446.05 $13.00 $346.50 $7.49
2.CNG ENGINE OIL

A. Price per Gallon (bulk) $8.89 No bid No bid $S6.74 No bid
3.SYNTHETIC AUTOMATIC
TRANSMISSION OIL

A. Price per Gallon (bulk) $28.59 $10.31 No bid $19.59 $46.95
4. DIFFERENTIAL OIL

A. Price per Gallon (bulk) $13.89 No bid No bid S$7.65 S1.74

B. Price per 55-gallon drum $14.79 ($813.45) $543.90 No bid $449.90 $1.74
5.CHASSIS LUBRICANT/BEARING
GREASE: EXTREME PRESSURE H.D.

A. Price per 55-gallon drum $1,439.00 ($3.60/1b) $722.29 No bid $676.00 $992.00

B. Price per 120-Ib drum $438.00 ($3.65/1b) $243.55 No bid $214.80 $329.00
6.ANTIFREEZE

A. Price per Gallon (bulk) $S0.00 No bid $6.25 $7.03 $7.49

B. Price per 55-gallon drum $7.49 $318.13 S440.00 $386.65 $7.49

Bidders are hereby notified that failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes and Board Policy 6320.02, or failure to
post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Offers received from the
vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if

any, are hereby rejected as late.

Opened By: June Kail

Date: May 10, 2017

Recorded By:

Olivia Willis

Date:

May 10, 2017




